


Erik Michael Hollerud September 27, 2004
707 6  Street NWth

Austin, MN 55912-2145

RE: Bradley Newman v. Erik Michael Hollerud, dba Hollerud Oil Company

DATE DESCRIPTION HOURS   AMOUNT   LWY

3/19/04 Review Summons and Complaint     .5          97.50 MCH

3/22/04 Review Notice from Bankruptcy Clerk     .1          19.50 MCH

4/5/04 Review Notice from Bankruptcy Court     .1          19.50 MCH

4/13/04 Letter to Bankruptcy Court     .4          78.00 MCH

Letter to Client     .4          78.00 MCH

5/3/04 Review 2  Summons and Service Documents     .2          39.00 MCHnd

5/6/04 Review  Scheduling Conference Order
Calendar Scheduling Conference     .2                 39.00 MCH

5/17/04 Meeting with Client re: Complaint     .5           97.50 MCH

Letter to Grundhoefer Law Firm     .9                175.50 MCH

5/27/04 Review Letter from Plaintiff’s Attorney     .3                  58.50 MCH

6/1/04 Draft and Execute Answer     .8                156.00 MCH

6/2/04 Serve and File Answer     .2           39.00 MCH

6/3/04 Prepare for Conference     .4           78.00 MCH

Travel Round Trip: Mankato-St. Paul    4.5         877.50 MCH

6/7/04 Review Scheduling Order
Calendar Scheduling Order     .1           19.50 MCH

7/27/04 Meeting with Client re: Summary
Judgment Affidavit    1.5               195.50 MCH

 
8/9/02 Draft Affidavit   1.2               234.00 MCH

8/11/02 Revise and Forward Affidavit     .6        117.50 MCH

8/16/04 Draft Summary Judgment, Motion, Answer, etc.   1.2        234.00 MCH



8/16/04 Revise, Serve and File Summary Judgment
Material  1.4         273.50 MCH

9/15/04 Review Plaintiff’s Affidavit   .4           78.00 MCH

9/25/04 Prepare for Hearing   .8        156.00 MCH

Review Billing and Draft Affidavit re: Fees   .7                  136.50 MCH

9/27/04 Estimated Travel Round Trip: Mankato-
St. Paul 4.5          877.50 MCH

9/27/04 Attend Hearing (estimated time)  .7         136.50 MCH

FEE SUMMARY:

Lawyer Hours                    Effective Rate Amount

Mark C. Halverson  22.60                     $195.00/hour $5,284.50

TOTAL FEES $4,407.00

DISBURSEMENTS

6/3/04 Mileage: 168 miles @ $.30/mile $50.40

9/27/04 Mileage: 168 miles @ $.30/mile $50.40

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS                              $100.80

                 TOTAL BILLING $4,507.80
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